



BUREAU OF CORRECTIONS
IWAHIG PRISON AND PENAL FARM
Puerto Princesa City



SUPPLEMENTAL/BID BULLETIN # 1

TO ALL PROSPECTIVE/INTERESTED BIDDERS FOR THE SUPPLY AND DELIVERY MEDICINES, AND MEDICAL/DENTAL SUPPLIES (January to June 2023) FOR PDL WITH THE TOTAL APPROVED BUDGET FOR THE CONTRACT (ABC) OF EIGHT MILLION NINE HUNDRED SIXTEEN THOUSAND SIX HUNDRED TWENTY SEVEN AND FORTY FIVE CENTAVOS (8,916,627.45).

AMENDMENTS ON THE BIDDING DOCUMENTS FOR SUPPLY AND DELIVERY MEDICINES, AND MEDICAL/DENTAL SUPPLIES (January to June 2023). Please see attached files

ORIGINAL BILL OF QUANTITIES

Project Name: <u>Supply and delivery of Medicines</u>					
Project Location: <u>Iwahig Prison and Penal Farm. Puerto Princesa City</u>					
Item No.	Description	Unit	Quantity	ABC	
				Unit Price (Pesos)	Amount (Pesos)
1.	ACETYLCYSTEINE 600MG EFFERVESCENT TABLET	TAB	1,500		
2.	ACICLOVIR 400MG	TAB	600		
3.	ALLOPURINOL 100mg	TAB	3,000		
4.	ALLOPURINOL 300mg	TAB	500		
5.	AMBROXOL 30MG	TAB	3,000		
6.	AMLODIPINE 10MG	TAB	30,000		
7.	AMLODIPINE 10MG + LOSARTAN 100MG	TAB	5,000		
8.	AMLODIPINE 5MG	TAB	30,000		
9.	AMOXICILLIN 500MG	CAP	2,500		
10.	ASCORBIC 500mg	TAB	60,000		
11.	ASPIRIN 80 mg ENTERIC COATED	TAB	3,000		

12.	ATORVASTATIN 10 mg	TAB	2,500		
13.	ATS (SERUM ANTI TETANUS 1500IU/ML, 1ML SOLUTION FOR INJECTION	AMP	75		
14.	AZITHROMYCIN 500mg	TAB	250		
15.	BACILLUS CLAUSII (ERCEFLORA)	AMP	2,500		
16.	BETAHISTINE dihydrochloride 16mg	TAB	500		
17.	BETAMETHASONE 0.1% CREAM 5G	TUBE	100		
18.	BETAMETHASONE 500MCG + GENTAMYCIN 1MG + TOLNAFTATE 10MG + CLIOQUINOL 10MG CREAM, 5G	TUBE	15		
19.	BETAMETHASONE+LEVOCETIRIZINE DIHCI 1MG/5MG FILM-COATED	TAB	500		
20.	BISACODYL 5mg sugar-coated tablet	TAB	500		
21.	BUDESONIDE 250MCG/ML, 2ML RESPIRATORY SOLUTION	NEB	500		
22.	BUTAMIRATE 50mg MODIFIED RELEASE TABLET	TAB	3,000		
23.	CANDESARTAN CILEXETIL 8MG	TAB	5,000		
24.	CAPTOPRIL 25mg	TAB	1,500		
25.	CARBAMAZEPINE 200mg	TAB	150		
26.	CARBIMAZOLE 5MG	TAB	250		
27.	CARBOCYSTEINE 500MG	CAP	3,000		
28.	CARVEDILOL 25 mg	TAB	1,500		
29.	CARVEDILOL 6.25 mg	TAB	1,500		
30.	CEFALEXIN 500mg	CAP	3,000		
31.	CEFIXIME 400MG CAPSULE	CAP	250		
32.	CEFTRIAZONE 1g POWDER FOR INJECTION + 10ML DILUENT	VIAL	250		
33.	CEFUROXIME 500MG	TAB	2,500		
34.	CEFUROXIME 750MG POWDER FOR INJECTION	VIAL	250		
35.	CELECOXIB 200mg	CAP	2,500		
36.	CETIRIZINE 10mg	TAB	3,000		
37.	CHLORPHENAMINE 4mg	TAB	1,500		
38.	CHLORPHENAMINE MALEATE IM/IV	AMP	15		
39.	CHLORPROMAZINE 100mg	TAB	1,000		
40.	CIPROFLOXACIN 500mg	TAB	2,500		

41.	CITICHOLINE 500mg	TAB	3,000		
42.	CITICHOLINE 500mg/5ml	AMP	50		
43.	CLINDAMYCIN 300mg	CAP	250		
44.	CLOBETASOL PROPRIONATE 0.05% CREAM, 5G	TUBE	50		
45.	CLONIDINE 75MCG	TAB	1,000		
46.	CLOPIDOGREL 75mg	TAB	5,000		
47.	CLOXACILLIN 500mg	CAP	3,000		
48.	CO-AMOXICLAV 1000MG/200MG POWDER FOR INJECTION	VIAL	25		
49.	CO-AMOXICLAV 625MG	TAB	3,000		
50.	COLCHICINE 500mcg	TAB	500		
51.	COTRIMOXAZOLE 800MG + 160MG	TAB	500		
52.	DE-OILED, ENRICHED PHOSPHOLIPIDS 300mg HARD CAPSULE	CAP	5,000		
53.	DEXAMETHASONE + TOBRAMYCIN 0.1% + 0.3%, 5ML EYE DROPS	BOT	15		
54.	DIGOXIN 250mcg	TAB	2,500		
55.	DIGOXIN 250MCG/ML 2ML	AMP	10		
56.	DIOSMIN+HESPERIDIN	TAB	500		
57.	DIPHENHYDRAMINE 50MG	CAP	3,000		
58.	DIPHENHYDRAMINE 50MG/ML, 1ML SOLUTION FOR INJECTION	AMP	10		
59.	DOPAMINE 40MG/ML, 5ML SOLUTION FOR INJECTION	AMP	5		
60.	DOXOFYLLINE 100MG	TAB	2,500		
61.	DOXYCYLINE 100mg	CAP	2,500		
62.	ENALAPRIL 20MG	TAB	2,500		
63.	EPINEPHRINE 1MG/ML, 1ML SOLUTION FOR INJECTION	AMP	30		
64.	ERYTHROMYCIN 0.5%, 3.5G EYE OINTMENT	TUBE	10		
65.	ESOMEPRAZOLE 40mg	CAP	2,500		
66.	FEBUXOSTAT 40mg	TAB	3,000		
67.	FENOFIBRATE 160MG TABLET	TAB	1,500		
68.	FINASTERIDE 5mg	TAB	1,000		
69.	FLUOCINOLONE ACETONIDE + NEOMYCIN + POLYMYXIN B 0.025% + 3.5MG + 10,000 UNITS/ ML, 5ML EAR DROPS	BOT	10		

70.	FOLIC ACID 5MG	TAB	30,000		
71.	FUROSEMIDE 10mg/ML, 2ML SOLUTION FOR INJECTION	AMP	10		
72.	FUROSEMIDE 40mg	TAB	2,500		
73.	GABAPENTIN 100mg	CAP	500		
74.	GABAPENTIN 300MG	CAP	250		
75.	GLICLAZIDE 80mg	TAB	2,500		
76.	GLIMEPERIDE 2MG	TAB	2,500		
77.	GLUTAMINE, FIBER, OLIGOSACCHARRIDE (GFO)	SCHT	2,500		
78.	GUAIFENESIN	CAP	5,000		
79.	HYDROCORTISONE 100mg POWDER FOR INJECTION	VIAL	100		
80.	HYDROGEN PEROXIDE 120ML	BOT	50		
81.	HYOSCINE AMP	AMP	15		
82.	HYPROMELLOSE 0.3%, 10ML EYE DROPS	BOT	15		
83.	INSULIN BASAGINE (GLARGINE)	VIAL	10		
84.	INSULIN BIPHASIC ISOPHANE HUMAN INSULIN 70/30, 100IU/ML, 10ML SOLUTION	VIAL	10		
85.	INSULIN REGULAR RDNA HUMAN 100IU/ML, 10ML SOUTION (HUMULIN R)	VIAL	10		
86.	IPRATROPIUM + SALBUTAMOL 500MCG + 2.5MG, 2.5ML RESPIRATORY SOLUTION	AMP	1,000		
87.	ISOSORBIDE-5-MONONITRATE 30mg MODIFIED RELEASE	TAB	5,000		
88.	ISOSORBIDE-5-MONONITRATE 60mg MODIFIED RELAESE	TAB	5,000		
89.	KETOANALOGUES 600MG	TAB	5,000		
90.	KETOCONAZOLE 2% 15GCREAM	TUBE	25		
91.	LAGUNDI 600MG (VITEX NEGUNDO L.)	TAB	3,000		
92.	LIDOCAINE 2%, 5ML SOLUTION FOR INJECTION	AMP	50		
93.	LINAGLIPTIN 50MG	TAB	5,000		
94.	LOPERAMIDE 2mg	CAP	2,500		
95.	LOSARTAN 50mg	TAB	25,000		
96.	MEFENAMIC ACID 500mg	CAP	2,500		
97.	METFORMIN 500mg tablet	TAB	6,000		

98.	METOCLOPRAMIDE 10MG	TAB	500		
99.	METOCLOPRAMIDE IM/IV	AMP	30		
100.	METOPROLOL 50mg tablet	TAB	7,500		
101.	METRONIDAZOLE 500mg	TAB	2,500		
102.	METRONIDAZOLE 5MG/ML, 100ML SOLUTION FOR INJECTION	VIAL	25		
103.	MONTELUKAST Na 10mg	TAB	1,500		
104.	MULTIVITAMINS CAPSULE	TAB	50,000		
105.	MUPIROCIN 2% CREAM 15g	TUBE	50		
106.	OFLOXACIN 0.3%, 5ML EAR DROPS	BOT	15		
107.	OFLOXACIN 200mg	TAB	1,500		
108.	OFLOXACIN 2MG/ML 100ML IV INFUSION	BOT	25		
109.	OMEPRAZOLE 40MG	CAP	1,500		
110.	OMEPRAZOLE 40MG POWDER FOR INJECTION + 10ML DILUENT	VIAL	35		
111.	PARACETAMOL 150MG/ML, 2ML SOLUTION FOR INJECTION	AMP	30		
112.	PARACETAMOL 325mg+PHENYLPROPANOLAMINE 25mg + DEXTROMETHORPHAN 10mg	CAP	5,000		
113.	PARACETAMOL 500mg	TAB	5,000		
114.	PARACETAMOL 500mg+ PHENYLEPHRINE 25mg + CHLORPHENAMINE MALEATE 2MG	TAB	5,000		
115.	PARACETAMOL+PROPYPHENAZONE+ CAFFEINE	TAB	2,000		
116.	PARACETAMOL+TRAMADOL CAP	TAB	1,500		
117.	PINENE 31mg, CAMPHENE 15mg, CINEOL 3mg, FENCHONE 4mg, BORNEOL 10mg, ANETHOL 4mg, OLIVE OIL 33mg CAPSULE	CAP	5,000		
118.	PIRACETAM 800MG FILM COATED	TAB	500		
119.	POLYMYXIN B SULFATE 0.71mg+ BACITRACIN ZINC 10mg + NEOMYCIN SULFATE 5mg SKIN OINTMENT 3.5G	TUBE	5		
120.	POLYMYXIN+NEOMYCIN+DEXAMETHASONE EYE DROPS /i-sore	BOT	25		
121.	POTASSIUM 10mEq SUSTAINED RELAESE TABLET	TAB	2,500		
122.	POVIDONE IODINE 1 GALLON	GAL	6		
123.	PROPYLTHIOURACIL 50MG TABLET	TAB	500		

124.	Protein 15.9g, fat 14g, carbohydrate 57.4g FOS/inulin 4.3g, water 5g, Vit. A palmitate 450mcg-RE, Vitamin A 20mcg, Vit. D3 4.8mcg, Vit. E 7.9mg, Vit. K1 21mcg, Vit. C 54mg, folic acid 130mcg, Vit.B1 0.8mg, Vit.B2 0.8mg, Vit. B6 1mg, Vit. B12 1.5mcg, niacin 8.2mg, pantothenic acid 4.2mg, biotin 18mcg, choline 136mg, Na 360mg, K 670mg, Cl 550mg, Ca 450mg, phosphorus 270mg, mg 80mg, Fe 2.4mg, Zn 4.7mg, manganese 1.4mg, Copper 285mcg, iodine 64mcg, selenium 22 mcg, chromium 23 mcg, molybdenum 42mcg PER 100g (800g) COMPLETE & BALANCED NUTRITION	CAN	100		
125.	RANITIDINE 25MG/ML, 2ML SOLUTION FOR INJECTION	AMP	25		
126.	ROSUVASTATIN 20MG	TAB	2,500		
127.	SALBUTAMOL 2mg	TAB	2,500		
128.	SALBUTAMOL+ GUAIFENESIN	CAP	5,000		
129.	SALMETEROL + FLUTICASONE 250MCG + 25MCG, 120 ACTUATIONS METERED DOSE INHALER	PC	100		
130.	Sambucus nigra L. Primula Veris L. & Primula elatior Rumex Crispus Verbena Officinalis Gentiana lutea	TAB	1,500		
131.	SILYBIN-PHOSPHATIDYLCHOLINE (1:2 RATIO) 120mg Dl-Alpha-tocopheryl acetate 12 mg Thiamine Mononitrate 1.1mg Riboflavin 1.1mg Niacinamide 14mg Pyridoxine HCl 1.3mg Cyanocobalamin 2.4mcg Calcium Pantothenate 5.4mg Zinc 5mg	CAP	3,000		
132.	SIMVASTATIN 40mg	TAB	2,500		
133.	SITAGLIPTIN PHOSPHATE 50MG	TAB	5,000		
134.	Sitagliptin Phosphate Monohydrate-64.25mg + Metformin Hydrochloride 500mg tablet	TAB	2,500		
135.	SPIRONOLACTONE 25mg	TAB	1,500		
136.	SULFUR SOAP	PC	100		
137.	TAMSULOSIN 200mcg	CAP	3,000		
138.	TELMISARTAN 40MG + AMLODIPINE 5MG	TAB	1,500		
139.	TELMISARTAN 80MG	TAB	1,500		
140.	TETANUS TOXOID 40IU/0.5ML	AMP	75		
141.	THIAMAZOLE 10MG	TAB	250		
142.	TOBRAMYCIN EYE DROPS	BOT	10		

143.	TRAMADOL 50MG CAPSULE	CAP	1,000		
144.	TRAMADOL 50mg/ML, 2ML SOLUTION FOR INJECTION	AMP	15		
145.	TRANEXAMIC ACID 500mg	CAP	250		
146.	TRANEXAMIC ACID 500mg im/iv	AMP	10		
147.	TRIMETAZIDINE 35MG MODIFIED RELEASE TABLET	TAB	3,000		
148.	VILDAGLIPTIN 50MG	TAB	1,500		
149.	VILDAGLIPTIN 50MG + METFORMIN 500MG	TAB	1,500		
150.	VIT. B1 100mg, VIT. B6 5mg, Vit. B12 50mcg TABLET	TAB	60,000		
151.	VIT. B1, VIT. B2, VIT. B3, VIT. B6, ASCORBIC ACID, D-PANTHENOL, DEXTROSE SOLUTION FOR INJECTION 20mL AMPULE	AMP	10		
152.	VITAMIN D3 800IU SOFTGEL	CAP	2,500		
<i>(Total amount in words)</i>					

Submitted by: _____
(Printed Name & Signature)

Designation: _____

Name of Company: _____

Date: _____

Project Name: <u>Supply and Delivery of Medical/Dental Supplies</u>					
Project Location: <u>Iwahig Prison and Penal Farm, Puerto Princesa City</u>					
Item No.	Description	Unit	Quantity	ABC	
				Unit Price (Pesos)	Amount (Pesos)
1.	ALCOHOL 70% 500 ML	BOT	250		
2.	AMBU BAG (BAG VALVE MASK) PVC, ADULT	PC	1		
3.	ARM SLING	PC	25		
4.	BASIN, KIDNEY, STAINLESS	PC	1		
5.	BLADE HOLDER (SCALPEL HANDLE), STAINLESS	PC	1		

6.	CARDIAC BOARD, STANDARD	PC	1		
7.	CLAMP, TOWEL	PC	2		
8.	COTTON BALL 300pcs/pack	PCK	250		
9.	DIAPER, ADULT LARGE	PC	100		
10.	DIAPER, ADULT MEDIUM	PC	150		
11.	DISINFECTANT SPRAY 500g	CAN	50		
12.	DISPOSABLE SHAVER	PC	50		
13.	DISPOSABLE SYRINGE 50cc	PC	50		
14.	DISPOSABLE SYRINGE INSULIN SYRINGE 100'S	BOX	2		
15.	EASY TOUGH BLOOD CHOLESTEROL STRIPS	BOX	5		
16.	EASY TOUCH BLOOD URIC ACID STRIPS	BOX	5		
17.	ELASTIC BANDAGE 2 X 6	PC	15		
18.	ELASTIC BANDAGE 3 X 6	PC	15		
19.	ELASTIC BANDAGE 6 X 6	PC	15		
20.	FACE MASK, MEDICAL, ADULT	BOX	100		
21.	FORCEPS, KELLY CURVE	PC	2		
22.	FORCEPS, KELLY STRAIGHT	PC	2		
23.	GLUCOMETER	UNIT	5		
24.	GLUCOSE TEST STRIPS	BOX	15		
25.	GOWN, LABORATORY	PC	1		
26.	I.V. CANNULA G.20/G.22, 100'S	BOX	5		
27.	I.V. STARTER KIT	PCK	15		
28.	ICE BAG / HOT WATER BAG	PC	5		
29.	MEDICAL SHARPS DISPOSABLE BOX, 5L	PC	30		
30.	MICROPORE 1" 12'S	BOX	25		
31.	MOUTH WASH, ANTIMICROBIAL 120ML	BOT	15		
32.	MORTAR AND PESTLE, MARBLE	PC	1		
33.	NEBULIZING KIT	PC	50		
34.	NEEDLE HOLDER	PC	2.5		

35.	NGT FEEDING TUBE SILICONE, ADULT	PC	25		
36.	OXYGEN CANNULA NASAL PRONG, ADULT	PC	30		
37.	OXYGEN FACE MASK, ADULT	PC	10		
38.	PAPER TOWEL, INTERFOLDED 1 PLY	PCK	150		
39.	STERILE LANCETS 100'S	PCK	10		
40.	SUCTION TIP, ORANGE	PC	5		
41.	SURGICAL GLOVES size 7.5	PC	50		
42.	SURGICAL GLOVES size 8	PC	50		
43.	TISSUE PAPER, 2-PLY 12's	PCK	100		
44.	TRANSPORE TAPE 3M	BOX	5		
45.	UNDERPAD, ADULT, 10 SHEETS/PACK	PCK	100		
46.	VACOSSET ADULT	PCS	50		
47.	WET WIPES, 80 SHEETS/PACK	PCS	150		
48.	IV EXTENSION TUBING 3MM	PCS	25		
49.	IV SPLINT, ADULT, WITH STRAP	PCS	50		
50.	BP APPARATUS, ANEROID, MANUAL, ADULT	PC	7		
51.	BP APPARATUS, EMERGENCY, 3 WHEELS HOLDER	PC	1		
52.	HOSPITAL BED LINEN, APPLE GREEN (80 x 36 inches)	PC	25		
53.	HOSPITAL BED MATTRESS, LEATHERETTE (80 x 36 inches)	PC	10		
54.	MEDICAL OXYGEN GAUGE REGULATOR	PC	2		
55.	MEDICAL OXYGEN OCTOPUS REGULATOR	PC	1		
56.	NEBULIZING MACHINE	PC	5		
57.	PILLOW, STANDARD SIZE, LEATHERETTE	PC	10		
58.	STETHOSCOPE, BRANDED, HEAVY DUTY, US MANUFACTURED	PC	5		
59.	URINAL, PLASTIC	PC	10		

60.	MEDICAL OXYGEN TANK, 50LBS WITH FULL CONTENT	PC	15		
61.	MEDICAL OXYGEN TANK, 20LBS WITH FULL CONTENT	PC	5		

Submitted by: _____

(Printed Name & Signature)

Designation: _____

Name of Company: _____

Date: _____

REVISED BILL OF QUANTITIES

Project Name: Supply and delivery of Medicines

Project Location: Iwahig Prison and Penal Farm. Puerto Princesa

City

Item No.	Description	Unit	Quantity	ABC		BID AMOUNT	
				Unit Price (Pesos)	Amount (Pesos)	Offered Price (per unit)	Offered Price (total)
1.	ACETYLCYSTEINE 600MG EFFERVESCENT TABLET	TAB	1,500	33.00	49,500.00		
2.	ACICLOVIR 400MG	TAB	600	30.00	18,000.00		
3.	ALLOPURINOL 100mg	TAB	3,000	5.00	15,000.00		
4.	ALLOPURINOL 300mg	TAB	500	10.00	5,000.00		
5.	AMBROXOL 30MG	TAB	3,000	7.00	21,000.00		
6.	AMLODIPINE 10MG	TAB	30,000	4.80	144,000.00		
7.	AMLODIPINE 10MG + LOSARTAN 100MG	TAB	5,000	18.00	90,000.00		
8.	AMLODIPINE 5MG	TAB	30,000	3.00	90,000.00		
9.	AMOXICILLIN 500MG	CAP	2,500	6.00	15,000.00		
10.	ASCORBIC 500mg	TAB	60,000	6.00	360,000.00		
11.	ASPIRIN 80 mg ENTERIC COATED	TAB	3,000	4.00	12,000.00		
12.	ATORVASTATIN 10 mg	TAB	2,500	10.00	25,000.00		
13.	ATS (SERUM ANTI TETANUS 1500IU/ML, 1ML SOLUTION FOR INJECTION	AMP	75	90.00	6,750.00		
14.	AZITHROMYCIN 500mg	TAB	250	79.67	19,917.50		
15.	BACILLUS CLAUSII (ERCEFLORA)	AMP	2,500	45.00	112,500.00		

16.	BETAHISTINE dihydrochloride 16mg	TAB	500	34.50	17,250.00		
17.	BETAMETHASON E 0.1% CREAM 5G	TUBE	100	149.00	14,900.00		
18.	BETAMETHASON E 500MCG + GENTAMYCIN 1MG + TOLNAFTATE 10MG + CLIOQUINOL 10MG CREAM, 5G	TUBE	15	680.00	10,200.00		
19.	BETAMETHASON E+LEVOCETIRIZI NE DIHCI 1MG/5MG FILM- COATED	TAB	500	28.75	14,375.00		
20.	BISACODYL 5mg sugar-coated tablet	TAB	500	5.00	2,500.00		
21.	BUDESONIDE 250MCG/ML, 2ML RESPIRATORY SOLUTION	NEB	500	55.00	27,500.00		
22.	BUTAMIRATE 50mg MODIFIED RELEASE TABLET	TAB	3,000	15.50	46,500.00		
23.	CANDESARTAN CILEXETIL 8MG	TAB	5,000	25.00	125,000.00		
24.	CAPTOPRIL 25mg	TAB	1,500	3.00	4,500.00		
25.	CARBAMAZEPIN E 200mg	TAB	150	2.25	337.50		
26.	CARBIMAZOLE 5MG	TAB	250	12.00	3,000.00		
27.	CARBOCYSTEINE 500MG	CAP	3,000	6.00	18,000.00		
28.	CARVEDILOL 25 mg	TAB	1,500	7.26	10,890.00		
29.	CARVEDILOL 6.25 mg	TAB	1,500	5.00	7,500.00		
30.	CEFALEXIN 500mg	CAP	3,000	6.40	19,200.00		
31.	CEFIXIME 400MG CAPSULE	CAP	250	33.00	8,250.00		
32.	CEFTRIAZONE 1g POWDER FOR INJECTION + 10ML DILUENT	VIAL	250	368.00	92,000.00		
33.	CEFUROXIME 500MG	TAB	2,500	44.00	110,000.00		

34.	CEFUROXIME 750MG POWDER FOR INJECTION	VIAL	250	90.00	22,500.00		
35.	CELECOXIB 200mg	CAP	2,500	19.00	47,500.00		
36.	CETIRIZINE 10mg	TAB	3,000	4.50	13,500.00		
37.	CHLORPHENAMI NE 4mg	TAB	1,500	0.99	1,485.00		
38.	CHLORPHENAMI NE MALEATE IM/IV	AMP	15	16.50	247.50		
39.	CHLORPROMAZI NE 100mg	TAB	1,000	5.63	5,630.00		
40.	CIPROFLOXACIN 500mg	TAB	2,500	8.00	20,000.00		
41.	CITICHOLINE 500mg	TAB	3,000	42.00	126,000.00		
42.	CITICHOLINE 500mg/5ml	AMP	50	215.00	10,750.00		
43.	CLINDAMYCIN 300mg	CAP	250	37.00	9,250.00		
44.	CLOBETASOL PROPRIONATE 0.05% CREAM, 5G	TUBE	50	115.00	5,750.00		
45.	CLONIDINE 75MCG	TAB	1,000	52.50	52,500.00		
46.	CLOPIDOGREL 75mg	TAB	5,000	18.50	92,500.00		
47.	CLOXACILLIN 500mg	CAP	3,000	11.00	33,000.00		
48.	CO-AMOXICLAV 1000MG/200MG POWDER FOR INJECTION	VIAL	25	215.00	5,375.00		
49.	CO-AMOXICLAV 625MG	TAB	3,000	19.00	57,000.00		
50.	COLCHICINE 500mcg	TAB	500	4.10	2,050.00		
51.	COTRIMOXAZOL E 800MG + 160MG	TAB	500	3.90	1,950.00		
52.	DE-OILED, ENRICHED PHOSPHOLIPIDS 300mg HARD CAPSULE	CAP	5,000	62.00	310,000.00		
53.	DEXAMETHASO NE + TOBRAMYCIN 0.1% + 0.3%, 5ML EYE DROPS	BOT	15	490.00	7,350.00		

54.	DIGOXIN 250mcg	TAB	2,500	5.00	12,500.00		
55.	DIGOXIN 250MCG/ML 2ML	AMP	10	210.00	2,100.00		
56.	DIOSMIN+HESPE RIDIN	TAB	500	95.00	47,500.00		
57.	DIPHENHYDRAM INE 50MG	CAP	3,000	3.50	10,500.00		
58.	DIPHENHYDRAM INE 50MG/ML, 1ML SOLUTION FOR INJECTION	AMP	10	98.00	980.00		
59.	DOPAMINE 40MG/ML, 5ML SOLUTION FOR INJECTION	AMP	5	234.50	1,172.50		
60.	DOXOFYLLINE 100MG	TAB	2,500	25.00	62,500.00		
61.	DOXYCYLINE 100mg	CAP	2,500	14.17	35,425.00		
62.	ENALAPRIL 20MG	TAB	2,500	12.00	30,000.00		
63.	EPINEPHRINE 1MG/ML, 1ML SOLUTION FOR INJECTION	AMP	30	80.00	2,400.00		
64.	ERYTHROMYCIN 0.5%, 3.5G EYE OINTMENT	TUBE	10	179.50	1,795.00		
65.	ESOMEPRAZOLE 40mg	CAP	2,500	145.00	362,500.00		
66.	FEBUXOSTAT 40mg	TAB	3,000	12.00	36,000.00		
67.	FENOFIBRATE 160MG TABLET	TAB	1,500	30.25	45,375.00		
68.	FINASTERIDE 5mg	TAB	1,000	12.00	12,000.00		
69.	FLUOCINOLONE ACETONIDE + NEOMYCIN + POLYMYXIN B 0.025% + 3.5MG + 10,000 UNITS/ ML, 5ML EAR DROPS	BOT	10	209.00	2,090.00		
70.	FOLIC ACID 5MG	TAB	30,000	5.00	150,000.00		
71.	FUROSEMIDE 10mg/ML, 2ML SOLUTION FOR INJECTION	AMP	10	20.00	200.00		
72.	FUROSEMIDE 40mg	TAB	2,500	2.50	6,250.00		

73.	GABAPENTIN 100mg	CAP	500	20.00	10,000.00		
74.	GABAPENTIN 300MG	CAP	250	20.00	5,000.00		
75.	GLICLAZIDE 80mg	TAB	2,500	5.00	12,500.00		
76.	GLIMEPERIDE 2MG	TAB	2,500	15.00	37,500.00		
77.	GLUTAMINE, FIBER, OLIGOSACCHAR RIDE (GFO)	SCHT	2,500	205.91	514,775.00		
78.	GUAIFENESIN	CAP	5,000	12.00	60,000.00		
79.	HYDROCORTISO NE 100mg POWDER FOR INJECTION	VIAL	100	95.00	9,500.00		
80.	HYDROGEN PEROXIDE 120MI	BOT	50	60.00	3,000.00		
81.	HYOSCINE AMP	AMP	15	35.00	525.00		
82.	HYPROMELLOSE 0.3%, 10ML EYE DROPS	BOT	15	298.00	4,470.00		
83.	INSULIN BASAGINE (GLARGINE)	VIAL	10	595.00	5,950.00		
84.	INSULIN BIPHASIC ISOPHANE HUMAN INSULIN 70/30, 100IU/ML, 10ML SOLUTION	VIAL	10	595.00	5,950.00		
85.	INSULIN REGULAR RDNA HUMAN 100IU/ML, 10ML SOLUTION (HUMULIN R)	VIAL	10	425.00	4,250.00		
86.	IPRATROPIUM + SALBUTAMOL 500MCG + 2.5MG, 2.5ML RESPIRATORY SOLUTION	AMP	1,000	32.50	32,500.00		
87.	ISOSORBIDE-5- MONONITRATE 30mg MODIFIED RELEASE	TAB	5,000	18.65	93,250.00		
88.	ISOSORBIDE-5- MONONITRATE	TAB	5,000	10.50	52,500.00		

	60mg MODIFIED RELAESE						
89.	KETOANALOGUE S 600MG	TAB	5,000	36.00	180,000.00		
90.	KETOCONAZOLE 2% 15GCREAM	TUBE	25	120.00	3,000.00		
91.	LAGUNDI 600MG (VITEX NEGUNDO L.)	TAB	3,000	3.41	10,230.00		
92.	LIDOCAINE 2%, 5ML SOLUTION FOR INJECTION	AMP	50	46.00	2,300.00		
93.	LINAGLIPTIN 50MG	TAB	5,000	60.00	300,000.00		
94.	LOPERAMIDE 2mg	CAP	2,500	3.80	9,500.00		
95.	LOSARTAN 50mg	TAB	25,000	9.00	225,000.00		
96.	MEFENAMIC ACID 500mg	CAP	2,500	10.80	27,000.00		
97.	METFORMIN 500mg tablet	TAB	6,000	7.58	45,480.00		
98.	METOCLOPRAMI DE 10MG	TAB	500	8.00	4,000.00		
99.	METOCLOPRAMI DE IM/IV	AMP	30	60.00	1,800.00		
100.	METOPROLOL 50mg tablet	TAB	7,500	3.00	22,500.00		
101.	METRONIDAZOL E 500mg	TAB	2,500	19.99	49,975.00		
102.	METRONIDAZOL E 5MG/ML, 100ML SOLUTION FOR INJECTION	VIAL	25	57.00	1,425.00		
103.	MONTELUKAST Na 10mg	TAB	1,500	8.67	13,005.00		
104.	MULTIVITAMINS CAPSULE	TAB	50,000	4.90	245,000.00		
105.	MUPIROCIN 2% CREAM 15g	TUBE	50	150.14	7,507.00		
106.	OFLOXACIN 0.3%, 5ML EAR DROPS	BOT	15	285.00	4,275.00		
107.	OFLOXACIN 200mg	TAB	1,500	4.30	6,450.00		
108.	OFLOXACIN 2MG/ML 100ML IV INFUSION	BOT	25	150.00	3,750.00		
109.	OMEPRAZOLE 40MG	CAP	1,500	87.30	130,950.00		

110.	OMEPRAZOLE 40MG POWDER FOR INJECTION + 10ML DILUENT	VIAL	35	335.00	11,725.00		
111.	PARACETAMOL 150MG/ML, 2ML SOLUTION FOR INJECTION	AMP	30	26.00	780.00		
112.	PARACETAMOL 325mg+PHENYLP ROPANOLAMINE 25mg + DEXTROMETHOR PHAN 10mg	CAP	5,000	10.00	50,000.00		
113.	PARACETAMOL 500mg	TAB	5,000	2.25	11,250.00		
114.	PARACETAMOL 500mg+ PHENYLEPHRINE 25mg + CHLORPHENAMI NE MALEATE 2MG	TAB	5,000	10.00	50,000.00		
115.	PARACETAMOL+ PROPYPHENAZO NE+CAFFEINE	TAB	2,000	10.00	20,000.00		
116.	PARACETAMOL+ TRAMADOL CAP	TAB	1,500	30.00	45,000.00		
117.	PINENE 31mg, CAMPHENE 15mg, CINEOL 3mg, FENCHONE 4mg, BORNEOL 10mg, ANETHOL 4mg, OLIVE OIL 33mg CAPSULE	CAP	5,000	56.000	280,000.00		
118.	PIRACETAM 800MG FILM COATED	TAB	500	42.000	21,000.00		
119.	POLYMYXIN B SULFATE 0.71mg+ BACITRACIN ZINC 10mg + NEOMYCIN SULFATE 5mg SKIN OINTMENT 3.5G	TUBE	5	230.00	1,150.00		
120.	POLYMYXIN+NE OMYCIN+DEXAM ETHASONE EYE DROPS /i-sore	BOT	25	225.00	5,625.00		
121.	POTASSIUM 10mEq	TAB	2,500	22.20	55,500.00		

	SUSTAINED RELAESE TABLET						
122.	POVIDONE IODINE 1 GALLON	GAL	6	850.00	5,100.00		
123.	PROPYLTHIOUR ACIL 50MG TABLET	TAB	500	13.00	6,500.00		
124.	Protein 15.9g, fat 14g, carbohydrate 57.4g FOS/inulin 4.3g, water 5g, Vit. A palmitate 450mcg-RE, Vitamin A 20mcg, Vit. D3 4.8mcg, Vit. E 7.9mg, Vit. K1 21mcg, Vit. C 54mg, folic acid 130mcg, Vit.B1 0.8mg, Vit.B2 0.8mg, Vit. B6 1mg, Vit. B12 1.5mcg, niacin 8.2mg, pantothenic acid 4.2mg, biotin 18mcg, choline 136mg, Na 360mg, K 670mg, Cl 550mg, Ca 450mg, phosphorus 270mg, mg 80mg, Fe 2.4mg, Zn 4.7mg, manganese 1.4mg, Copper 285mcg, iodine 64mcg, selenium 22 mcg, chromium 23 mcg, molybdenum 42mcg PER 100g (800g) COMPLETE & BALANCED NUTRITION	CAN	100	1499.00	149,900.00		
125.	RANITIDINE 25MG/ML, 2ML SOLUTION FOR INJECTION	AMP	25	23.78	594.50		
126.	ROSUVASTATIN 20MG	TAB	2,500	22.34	55,850.00		
127.	SALBUTAMOL 2mg	TAB	2,500	5.00	12,500.00		
128.	SALBUTAMOL+ GUAIFENESIN	CAP	5,000	6.00	30,000.00		

129.	SALMETEROL + FLUTICASONE 250MCG + 25MCG, 120 ACTUATIONS METERED DOSE INHALER	PC	100	392.00	39,200.00		
130.	Sambucus nigra L. Primula Veris L. & Primula elatior Rumex Crispus Verbena Officinalis Gentiana lutea	TAB	1,500	18.00	27,000.00		
131.	SILYBIN- PHOSPHATIDYLC HOLINE (1:2 RATIO) 120mg DI- Alpha-tocopheryl acetate 12 mg Thiamine Mononitrate 1.1mg Riboflavin 1.1mg Niacinamide 14mg Pyridoxine HCl 1.3mg Cyanocobalamin 2.4mcg Calcium Pantothenate 5.4mg Zinc 5mg	CAP	3,000	38.00	114,000.00		
132.	SIMVASTATIN 40mg	TAB	2,500	6.00	15,000.00		
133.	SITAGLIPTIN PHOSPHATE 50MG	TAB	5,000	60.00	300,000.00		
134.	Sitagliptin Phosphate Monohydrate- 64.25mg + Metformin Hydrochloride 500mg tablet	TAB	2,500	77.00	192,500.00		
135.	SPIRONOLACTO NE 25mg	TAB	1,500	145.00	217,500.00		
136.	SULFUR SOAP	PC	100	110.00	11,000.00		
137.	TAMSULOSIN 200mcg	CAP	3,000	42.28	126,840.00		
138.	TELMISARTAN 40MG + AMLODIPINE 5MG	TAB	1,500	30.00	45,000.00		
139.	TELMISARTAN 80MG	TAB	1,500	34.00	51,000.00		

140.	TETANUS TOXOID 40IU/0.5ML	AMP	75	80.00	6,000.00		
141.	THIAMAZOLE 10MG	TAB	250	25.00	6,250.00		
142.	TOBRAMYCIN EYE DROPS	BOT	10	299.89	2,998.90		
143.	TRAMADOL 50MG CAPSULE	CAP	1,000	18.00	18,000.00		
144.	TRAMADOL 50mg/ML, 2ML SOLUTION FOR INJECTION	AMP	15	94.97	1,424.55		
145.	TRANEXAMIC ACID 500mg	CAP	250	48.98	12,245.00		
146.	TRANEXAMIC ACID 500mg im/iv	AMP	10	370.00	3,700.00		
147.	TRIMETAZIDINE 35MG MODIFIED RELEASE TABLET	TAB	3,000	13.33	39,990.00		
148.	VILDAGLIPTIN 50MG	TAB	1,500	58.00	87,000.00		
149.	VILDAGLIPTIN 50MG + METFORMIN 500MG	TAB	1,500	68.00	102,000.00		
150.	VIT. B1 100mg, VIT. B6 5mg, Vit. B12 50mcg TABLET	TAB	60,000	11.00	660,000.00		
151.	VIT. B1, VIT. B2, VIT. B3, VIT. B6, ASCORBIC ACID, D-PANTHENOL, DEXTROSE SOLUTION FOR INJECTION 20mL AMPULE	AMP	10	34.00	340.00		
152.	VITAMIN D3 800IU SOFTGEL	CAP	2,500	10.41	26,025.00		
<i>(Total amount in words)</i>							

Project Name: Supply and Delivery of Medical/Dental Supplies
 Project Location: Iwahig Prison and Penal Farm, Puerto Princesa
City

Item No.	Description	Unit	Quantity	ABC		BID AMOUNT	
				Unit Price (Pesos)	Amount (Pesos)	Offered Price (per unit)	Offered Price (total)
1.	ALCOHOL 70% 500 ML	BOT	250	120.00	30,000.00		
2.	AMBU BAG (BAG VALVE MASK) PVC, ADULT	PC	1	1,300.00	1,300.00		
3.	ARM SLING	PC	25	200.00	5,000.00		
4.	BASIN, KIDNEY, STAINLESS	PC	1	295.00	295.00		
5.	BLADE HOLDER (SCALPEL HANDLE), STAINLESS	PC	1	290.00	290.00		
6.	CARDIAC BOARD, STANDARD	PC	1	3,000.25	3,000.25		
7.	CLAMP, TOWEL	PC	2	300.00	600.00		
8.	COTTON BALL 300pcs/pack	PCK	250	130.00	32,500.00		
9.	DIAPER, ADULT LARGE	PC	100	75.00	7,500.00		
10.	DIAPER, ADULT MEDIUM	PC	150	75.00	11,250.00		
11.	DISINFECTANT SPRAY 500g	CAN	50	280.00	14,000.00		
12.	DISPOSABLE SHAVER	PC	50	30.00	1,500.00		
13.	DISPOSABLE SYRINGE 50cc	PC	50	90.00	4,500.00		
14.	DISPOSABLE SYRINGE INSULIN SYRINGE 100'S	BOX	2	500.00	1,000.00		
15.	EASY TOUGH BLOOD CHOLESTEROL STRIPS	BOX	5	1,300.00	6,500.00		
16.	EASY TOUCH BLOOD URIC ACID STRIPS	BOX	5	1,300.00	6,500.00		
17.	ELASTIC BANDAGE 2 X 6	PC	15	34.00	510.00		
18.	ELASTIC BANDAGE 3 X 6	PC	15	50.00	750.00		
19.	ELASTIC BANDAGE 6 X 6	PC	15	110.00	1,650.00		
20.	FACE MASK, MEDICAL, ADULT	BOX	100	140.00	14,000.00		

21.	FORCEPS, KELLY CURVE	PC	2	650.00	1,300.00		
22.	FORCEPS, KELLY STRAIGHT	PC	2	650.00	1,300.00		
23.	GLUCOMETER	UNIT	5	1,600.00	8,000.00		
24.	GLUCOSE TEST STRIPS	BOX	15	1,300.00	19,500.00		
25.	GOWN, LABORATORY	PC	1	160.00	160.00		
26.	I.V. CANNULA G.20/G.22, 100'S	BOX	5	2,100.00	10,500.00		
27.	I.V. STARTER KIT	PCK	15	75.00	1,125.00		
28.	ICE BAG / HOT WATER BAG	PC	5	120.00	600.00		
29.	MEDICAL SHARPS DISPOSABLE BOX, 5L	PC	30	200.00	6,000.00		
30.	MICROPORE 1" 12'S	BOX	25	490.00	12,250.00		
31.	MOUTH WASH, ANTIMICROBIAL 120ML	BOT	15	150.00	2,250.00		
32.	MORTAR AND PESTLE, MARBLE	PC	1	899.75	899.75		
33.	NEBULIZING KIT	PC	50	45.00	2,250.00		
34.	NEEDLE HOLDER	PC	2.5	500.00	1,250.00		
35.	NGT FEEDING TUBE SILICONE, ADULT	PC	25	240.00	6,000.00		
36.	OXYGEN CANNULA NASAL PRONG, ADULT	PC	30	55.00	1,650.00		
37.	OXYGEN FACE MASK, ADULT	PC	10	85.00	850.00		
38.	PAPER TOWEL, INTERFOLDED 1 PLY	PCK	150	220.00	33,000.00		
39.	STERILE LANCETS 100'S	PCK	10	300.00	3,000.00		
40.	SUCTION TIP, ORANGE	PC	5	309.50	1,547.50		
41.	SURGICAL GLOVES size 7.5	PC	50	25.00	1,250.00		
42.	SURGICAL GLOVES size 8	PC	50	25.00	1,250.00		
43.	TISSUE PAPER, 2-PLY 12's	PCK	100	160.00	16,000.00		
44.	TRANSPORE TAPE 3M	BOX	5	990.00	4,950.00		
45.	UNDERPAD, ADULT, 10 SHEETS/PACK	PCK	100	400.00	40,000.00		
46.	VACOSSET ADULT	PCS	50	75.00	3,750.00		

47.	WET WIPES, 80 SHEETS/PACK	PCS	150	119.00	17,850.00		
48.	IV EXTENSION TUBING 3MM	PCS	25	120.00	3,000.00		
49.	IV SPLINT, ADULT, WITH STRAP	PCS	50	200.00	10,000.00		
50.	BP APPARATUS, ANEROID, MANUAL, ADULT	PC	7	1,500.00	10,500.00		
51.	BP APPARATUS, EMERGENCY, 3 WHEELS HOLDER	PC	1	3,000.00	3,000.00		
52.	HOSPITAL BED LINEN, APPLE GREEN (80 x 36 inches)	PC	25	400.00	10,000.00		
53.	HOSPITAL BED MATRESS, LEATHERETTE (80 x 36 inches)	PC	10	5,000.00	50,000.00		
54.	MEDICAL OXYGEN GAUGE REGULATOR	PC	2	3,000.00	6,000.00		
55.	MEDICAL OXYGEN OCTOPUS REGULATOR	PC	1	10,000.00	10,000.00		
56.	NEBULIZING MACHINE	PC	5	2,500.00	12,500.00		
57.	PILLOW, STANDARD SIZE, LEATHERETTE	PC	10	500.00	5,000.00		
58.	STETHOSCOPE, BRANDED, HEAVY DUTY, US MANUFACTURED	PC	5	7,000.00	35,000.00		
59.	URINAL, PLASTIC	PC	10	200.00	2,000.00		
60.	MEDICAL OXYGEN TANK, 50LBS WITH FULL CONTENT	PC	15	9,900.00	148,500.00		
61.	MEDICAL OXYGEN TANK, 20LBS WITH FULL CONTENT	PC	5	9,300.00	46,500.00		

Submitted by: _____
(Printed Name & Signature)

Designation: _____

Name of Company: _____

Date: _____

Section VII. Technical Specifications

Original Technical Specifications

GROUP A - MEDICINES										
NO.	ITEM DESCRIPTION	QTY	UOM	Bidder's Offer						
				<i>(Kindly indicate the complete information below especially the specifications & brand for each item. Put "NO BID", if applicable)</i>						
				ABC (₱)	Complete Specifications	Item Code	Brand	Country of Origin	Manufacturer	CPR No.
1.	ACETYLCYSTEINE 600MG EFFERVESCENT TABLET	1,500	TAB							
2.	ACICLOVIR 400MG	600	TAB							
3.	ALLOPURINOL 100mg	3,000	TAB							
4.	ALLOPURINOL 300mg	500	TAB							
5.	AMBROXOL 30MG	3,000	TAB							
6.	AMLODIPINE 10MG	30,000	TAB							
7.	AMLODIPINE 10MG + LOSARTAN 100MG	5,000	TAB							
8.	AMLODIPINE 5MG	30,000	TAB							
9.	AMOXICILLIN 500MG	2,500	CAP							
10.	ASCORBIC 500mg	60,000	TAB							

11.	ASPIRIN 80 mg ENTERIC COATED	3,000	TAB						
12.	ATORVASTATIN 10 mg	2,500	TAB						
13.	ATS (SERUM ANTI TETANUS 1500IU/ML, 1ML SOLUTION FOR INJECTION	75	AMP						
14.	AZITHROMYCIN 500mg	250	TAB						
15.	BACILLUS CLAUSII	2,500	AMP						
16.	BETAHISTINE dihydrochloride 16mg	500	TAB						
17.	BETAMETHASONE 0.1% CREAM 5G	100	TUBE						
18.	BETAMETHASONE 500MCG + GENTAMYCIN 1MG + TOLNAFTATE 10MG + CLIOQUINOL 10MG CREAM, 5G	15	TUBE						
19.	BETAMETHASONE+LEVOC ETIRIZINE DIHCl 1MG/5MG FILM-COATED	500	TAB						
20.	BISACODYL 5mg sugar-coated tablet	500	TAB						
21.	BUDESONIDE 250MCG/ML, 2ML RESPIRATORY SOLUTION	500	NEB						
22.	BUTAMIRATE 50mg MODIFIED RELEASE TABLET	3,000	TAB						
23.	CANDESARTAN CILEXETIL 8MG	5,000	TAB						

24.	CAPTOPRIL 25mg	1,500	TAB							
25.	CARBAMAZEPINE 200mg	150	TAB							
26.	CARBIMAZOLE 5MG	250	TAB							
27.	CARBOCYSTEINE 500MG	3,000	CAP							
28.	CARVEDILOL 25 mg	1,500	TAB							
29.	CARVEDILOL 6.25 mg	1,500	TAB							
30.	CEFALEXIN 500mg	3,000	CAP							
31.	CEFIXIME 400MG CAPSULE	250	CAP							
32.	CEFTRIAZONE 1g POWDER FOR INJECTION + 10ML DILUENT	250	VIAL							
33.	CEFUROXIME 500MG	2,500	TAB							
34.	CEFUROXIME 750MG POWDER FOR INJECTION	250	VIAL							
35.	CELECOXIB 200mg	2,500	CAP							
36.	CETIRIZINE 10mg	3,000	TAB							
37.	CHLORPHENAMINE 4mg	1,500	TAB							
38.	CHLORPHENAMINE MALEATE IM/IV	15	AMP							
39.	CHLORPROMAZINE 100mg	1,000	TAB							
40.	CIPROFLOXACIN 500mg	2,500	TAB							
41.	CITICHOLINE 500mg	3,000	TAB							
42.	CITICHOLINE 500mg/5ml	50	AMP							

43.	CLINDAMYCIN 300mg	250	CAP						
44.	CLOBETASOL PROPRIONATE 0.05% CREAM, 5G	50	TUBE						
45.	CLONIDINE 75MCG	1,000	TAB						
46.	CLOPIDOGREL 75mg	5,000	TAB						
47.	CLOXACILLIN 500mg	3,000	CAP						
48.	CO-AMOXICLAV 1000MG/200MG POWDER FOR INJECTION	25	VIAL						
49.	CO-AMOXICLAV 625MG	3,000	TAB						
50.	COLCHICINE 500mcg	500	TAB						
51.	COTRIMOXAZOLE 800MG + 160MG	500	TAB						
52.	DE-OILED, ENRICHED PHOSPHOLIPIDS 300mg HARD CAPSULE	5,000	CAP						
53.	DEXAMETHASONE + TOBRAMYCIN 0.1% + 0.3%, 5ML EYE DROPS	15	BOT						
54.	DIGOXIN 250mcg	2,500	TAB						
55.	DIGOXIN 250MCG/ML 2ML	10	AMP						
56.	DIOSMIN+HESPERIDIN	500	TAB						
57.	DIPHENHYDRAMINE 50MG	3,000	CAP						

58.	DIPHENHYDRAMINE 50MG/ML, 1ML SOLUTION FOR INJECTION	10	AMP							
59.	DOPAMINE 40MG/ML, 5ML SOLUTION FOR INJECTION	5	AMP							
60.	DOXOFYLLINE 100MG	2,500	TAB							
61.	DOXYCYLINE 100mg	2,500	CAP							
62.	ENALAPRIL 20MG	2,500	TAB							
63.	EPINEPHRINE 1MG/ML, 1ML SOLUTION FOR INJECTION	30	AMP							
64.	ERYTHROMYCIN 0.5%, 3.5G EYE OINTMENT	10	TUBE							
65.	ESOMEPRAZOLE 40mg	2,500	CAP							
66.	FEBUXOSTAT 40mg	3,000	TAB							
67.	FENOFIBRATE 160MG TABLET	1,500	TAB							
68.	FINASTERIDE 5mg	1,000	TAB							
69.	FLUOCINOLONE ACETONIDE + NEOMYCIN + POLYMXIN B 0.025% + 3.5MG + 10,000 UNITS/ ML, 5ML EAR DROPS	10	BOT							
70.	FOLIC ACID 5MG	30,000	TAB							
71.	FUROSEMIDE 10mg/ML, 2ML SOLUTION FOR INJECTION	10	AMP							
72.	FUROSEMIDE 40mg	2,500	TAB							
73.	GABAPENTIN 100mg	500	CAP							
74.	GABAPENTIN 300MG	250	CAP							

75.	GLICLAZIDE 80mg	2,500	TAB							
76.	GLIMEPERIDE 2MG	2,500	TAB							
77.	GLUTAMINE, FIBER, OLIGOSACCHARRIDE (GFO)	2,500	SCHT							
78.	GUAIFENESIN	5,000	CAP							
79.	HYDROCORTISONE 100mg POWDER FOR INJECTION	100	VIAL							
80.	HYDROGEN PEROXIDE 120MI	50	BOT							
81.	HYOSCINE AMP	15	AMP							
82.	HYPROMELLOSE 0.3%, 10ML EYE DROPS	15	BOT							
83.	INSULIN BASAGINE (GLARGINE)	10	VIAL							
84.	INSULIN BIPHASIC ISOPHANE HUMAN INSULIN 70/30, 100IU/ML, 10ML SOLUTION	10	VIAL							
85.	INSULIN REGULAR RDNA HUMAN 100IU/ML, 10ML SOUTION (HUMULIN R)	10	VIAL							
86.	IPRATROPIUM + SALBUTAMOL 500MCG + 2.5MG, 2.5ML RESPIRATORY SOLUTION	1,000	AMP							
87.	ISOSORBIDE-5- MONONITRATE 30mg MODIFIED RELEASE	5,000	TAB							
88.	ISOSORBIDE-5- MONONITRATE 60mg MODIFIED RELAESE	5,000	TAB							

89.	KETOANALOGUES 600MG	5,000	TAB						
90.	KETOCONAZOLE 2% 15GCREAM	25	TUBE						
91.	LAGUNDI 600MG (VITEX NEGUNDO L.)	3,000	TAB						
92.	LIDOCAINE 2%, 5ML SOLUTION FOR INJECTION	50	AMP						
93.	LINAGLIPTIN 50MG	5,000	TAB						
94.	LOPERAMIDE 2mg	2,500	CAP						
95.	LOSARTAN 50mg	25,000	TAB						
96.	MEFENAMIC ACID 500mg	2,500	CAP						
97.	METFORMIN 500mg tablet	6,000	TAB						
98.	METOCLOPRAMIDE 10MG	500	TAB						
99.	METOCLOPRAMIDE IM/IV	30	AMP						
100.	METOPROLOL 50mg tablet	7,500	TAB						
101.	METRONIDAZOLE 500mg	2,500	TAB						
102.	METRONIDAZOLE 5MG/ML, 100ML SOLUTION FOR INJECTION	25	VIAL						
103.	MONTELUKAST Na 10mg	1,500	TAB						
104.	MULTIVITAMINS CAPSULE	50,000	TAB						
105.	MUPIROCIN 2% CREAM 15g	50	TUBE						
106.	OFLOXACIN 0.3%, 5ML EAR DROPS	15	BOT						

107.	OFLOXACIN 200mg	1,500	TAB						
108.	OFLOXACIN 2MG/ML 100ML IV INFUSION	25	BOT						
109.	OMEPRazole 40MG	1,500	CAP						
110.	OMEPRazole 40MG POWDER FOR INJECTION + 10ML DILUENT	35	VIAL						
111.	PARACETAMOL 150MG/ML, 2ML SOLUTION FOR INJECTION	30	AMP						
112.	PARACETAMOL 325mg+PHENYLPROPANOL AMINE 25mg + DEXTROMETHORPHAN 10mg	5,000	CAP						
113.	PARACETAMOL 500mg	5,000	TAB						
114.	PARACETAMOL 500mg+ PHENYLEPHRINE 25mg + CHLORPHENAMINE MALEATE 2MG	5,000	TAB						
115.	PARACETAMOL+PROPYPH ENAZONE+CAFFEINE	2,000	TAB						
116.	PARACETAMOL+TRAMADO L CAP	1,500	TAB						
117.	PINENE 31mg, CAMPHENE 15mg, CINEOL 3mg, FENCHONE 4mg, BORNEOL 10mg, ANETHOL 4mg, OLIVE OIL 33mg CAPSULE	5,000	CAP						
118.	PIRACETAM 800MG FILM COATED	500	TAB						

119.	POLYMYXIN B SULFATE 0.71mg+ BACITRACIN ZINC 10mg + NEOMYCIN SULFATE 5mg SKIN OINTMENT 3.5G	5	TUBE						
120.	POLYMYXIN+NEOMYCIN+ DEXAMETHASONE EYE DROPS	25	BOT						
121.	POTASSIUM 10mEq SUSTAINED RELAESE TABLET	2,500	TAB						
122.	POVIDONE IODINE 1 GALLON	6	GAL						
123.	PROPYLTHIOURACIL 50MG TABLET	500	TAB						
124.	Protein 15.9g, fat 14g, carbohydrate 57.4g FOS/inulin 4.3g, water 5g, Vit. A palmitate 450mcg-RE, Vitamin A 20mcg, Vit. D3 4.8mcg, Vit. E 7.9mg, Vit. K1 21mcg, Vit. C 54mg, folic acid 130mcg, Vit.B1 0.8mg, Vit.B2 0.8mg, Vit. B6 1mg, Vit. B12 1.5mcg, niacin 8.2mg, pantothenic acid 4.2mg, biotin 18mcg, choline 136mg, Na 360mg, K 670mg, Cl 550mg, Ca 450mg, phosphorus 270mg, mg 80mg, Fe 2.4mg, Zn 4.7mg, manganese 1.4mg, Copper 285mcg, iodine 64mcg, selenium 22 mcg, chromium 23 mcg, molybdenum 42mcg PER	100	CAN						

	100g (800g) COMPLETE & BALANCED NUTRITION									
125.	RANITIDINE 25MG/ML, 2ML SOLUTION FOR INJECTION	25	AMP							
126.	ROSUVASTATIN 20MG	2,500	TAB							
127.	SALBUTAMOL 2mg	2,500	TAB							
128.	SALBUTAMOL+ GUAIFENESIN	5,000	CAP							
129.	SALMETEROL + FLUTICASONE 250MCG + 25MCG, 120 ACTUATIONS METERED DOSE INHALER	100	PC							
130.	Sambucus nigra L. Primula Veris L. & Primula elatior Rumex Crispus Verbena Officinalis Gentiana lutea	1,500	TAB							
131.	SILYBIN-PHOSPHATIDYLCHOLINE (1:2 RATIO) 120mg Di-Alpha-tocopheryl acetate 12 mg Thiamine Mononitrate 1.1mg Riboflavin 1.1mg Niacinamide 14mg Pyridoxine HCl 1.3mg Cyanocobalamin 2.4mcg Calcium Pantothenate 5.4mg Zinc 5mg	3,000	CAP							
132.	SIMVASTATIN 40mg	2,500	TAB							
133.	SITAGLIPTIN PHOSPHATE 50MG	5,000	TAB							

134.	Sitagliptin Phosphate Monohydrate-64.25mg + Metformin Hydrochloride 500mg tablet	2,500	TAB							
135.	SPIRONOLACTONE 25mg	1,500	TAB							
136.	SULFUR SOAP	100	PC							
137.	TAMSULOSIN 200mcg	3,000	CAP							
138.	TELMISARTAN 40MG + AMLODIPINE 5MG	1,500	TAB							
139.	TELMISARTAN 80MG	1,500	TAB							
140.	TETANUS TOXOID 40IU/0.5ML	75	AMP							
141.	THIAMAZOLE 10MG	250	TAB							
142.	TOBRAMYCIN EYE DROPS	10	BOT							
143.	TRAMADOL 50MG CAPSULE	1,000	CAP							
144.	TRAMADOL 50mg/ML, 2ML SOLUTION FOR INJECTION	15	AMP							
145.	TRANEXAMIC ACID 500mg	250	CAP							
146.	TRANEXAMIC ACID 500mg im/iv	10	AMP							
147.	TRIMETAZIDINE 35MG MODIFIED RELEASE TABLET	3,000	TAB							
148.	VILDAGLIPTIN 50MG	1,500	TAB							
149.	VILDAGLIPTIN 50MG + METFORMIN 500MG	1,500	TAB							

150.	VIT. B1 100mg, VIT. B6 5mg, Vit. B12 50mcg TABLET	60,000	TAB						
151.	VIT. B1, VIT. B2, VIT. B3, VIT. B6, ASCORBIC ACID, D- PANTHENOL, DEXTROSE SOLUTION FOR INJECTION 20mL AMPULE	10	AMP						
152.	VITAMIN D3 800IU SOFTGEL	2,500	CAP						

GROUP B – VARIOUS MEDICAL AND LABORATORY SUPPLIES

NO.	ITEM DESCRIPTION	QTY	UOM	Bidder's Offer					
				<i>(Kindly indicate the complete information below especially the specifications & brand for each item. Put "NO BID", if applicable)</i>					
				ABC (₱)	Complete Specifications	Brand	Country of Origin	Manufacturer	CPR No.
1.	ALCOHOL 70% 500 ML	250	BOT						
2.	AMBU BAG (BAG VALVE MASK) PVC, ADULT	1	PC						

3.	ARM SLING	25	PC						
4.	BASIN, KIDNEY, STAINLESS	1	PC						
5.	BLADE HOLDER (SCALPEL HANDLE), STAINLESS	1	PC						
6.	CARDIAC BOARD, STANDARD	1	PC						
7.	CLAMP, TOWEL	2	PC						
8.	COTTON BALL 300pcs/pack	250	PCK						
9.	DIAPER, ADULT LARGE	100	PC						
10.	DIAPER, ADULT MEDIUM	150	PC						
11.	DISINFECTANT SPRAY 500g	50	CAN						
12.	DISPOSABLE SHAVER	50	PC						
13.	DISPOSABLE SYRINGE 50cc	50	PC						
14.	DISPOSABLE SYRINGE INSULIN SYRINGE 100'S	2	BOX						
15.	EASY TOUGH BLOOD CHOLESTEROL STRIPS	5	BOX						
16.	EASY TOUCH BLOOD URIC ACID STRIPS	5	BOX						
17.	ELASTIC BANDAGE 2 X 6	15	PC						
18.	ELASTIC BANDAGE 3 X 6	15	PC						
19.	ELASTIC BANDAGE 6 X 6	15	PC						
20.	FACE MASK, MEDICAL, ADULT	100	BOX						

21.	FORCEPS, KELLY CURVE	2	PC						
22.	FORCEPS, KELLY STRAIGHT	2	PC						
23.	GLUCOMETER	5	UNIT						
24.	GLUCOSE TEST STRIPS	15	BOX						
25.	GOWN, LABORATORY	1	PC						
26.	I.V. CANNULA G.20/G.22, 100'S	5	BOX						
27.	I.V. STARTER KIT	15	PCK						
28.	ICE BAG / HOT WATER BAG	5	PC						
29.	MEDICAL SHARPS DISPOSABLE BOX, 5L	30	PC						
30.	MICROPORE 1" 12'S	25	BOX						
31.	MOUTH WASH, ANTIMICROBIAL 120ML	15	BOT						
32.	MORTAR AND PESTLE, MARBLE	1	PC						
33.	NEBULIZING KIT	50	PC						
34.	NEEDLE HOLDER	2	PC						
35.	NGT FEEDING TUBE SILICONE, ADULT	25	PC						
36.	OXYGEN CANNULA NASAL PRONG, ADULT	30	PC						
37.	OXYGEN FACE MASK, ADULT	10	PC						
38.	PAPER TOWEL, INTERFOLDED 1 PLY	150	PCK						

39.	STERILE LANCETS 100'S	10	PCK						
40.	SUCTION TIP, ORANGE	5	PC						
41.	SURGICAL GLOVES size 7.5	50	PC						
42.	SURGICAL GLOVES size 8	50	PC						
43.	TISSUE PAPER, 2-PLY 12's	100	PCK						
44.	TRANSPORE TAPE 3M	5	BOX						
45.	UNDERPAD, ADULT, 10 SHEETS/PACK	100	PCK						
46.	VACASET ADULT	50	PCS						
47.	WET WIPES, 80 SHEETS/PACK	150	PCS						
48.	IV EXTENSION TUBING 3MM	25	PCS						
49.	IV SPLINT, ADULT, WITH STRAP	50	PCS						
50.	BP APPARATUS, ANEROID, MANUAL, ADULT	7	PC						
51.	BP APPARATUS, EMERGENCY, 3 WHEELS HOLDER	1	PC						
52.	HOSPITAL BED LINEN, APPLE GREEN, FITTED, 80 X 36 INCHES	25	PC						
53.	HOSPITAL BED MATRESS, LEATHERETTE, 80 X 36 INCHES	10	PC						

54.	MEDICAL OXYGEN GAUGE REGULATOR	2	PC						
55.	MEDICAL OXYGEN OCTOPUS REGULATOR	1	PC						
56.	NEBULIZING MACHINE	5	PC						
57.	PILLOW, STANDARD SIZE, LEATHERETTE	10	PC						
58.	STETHOSCOPE, BRANDED, HEAVY DUTY, US MANUFACTURED	5	PC						
59.	URINAL, PLASTIC	10	PC						
60.	MEDICAL OXYGEN 50LBS CONTENT WITH TANK	15	PC						
61.	MEDICAL OXYGEN 20LBS CONTENT WITH TANK	5	PC						

I hereby certify that the above information is good for agreement.

Signature Over Printed Name of Authorized Representative.: _____

Name of Company: _____

Section VII. Technical Specifications

Revised Technical Specifications

GROUP A - MEDICINES										
NO.	ITEM DESCRIPTION	QTY	UOM	Bidder's Offer						
				<i>(Kindly indicate the complete information below especially the specifications & brand for each item. Put "NO BID", if applicable)</i>						
				ABC (₱)	Complete Specifications	Item Code	Brand	Country of Origin	Manufacturer	CPR No.
1.	ACETYLCYSTEINE 600MG EFFERVESCENT TABLET	1,500	TAB	49,500.00						
2.	ACICLOVIR 400MG	600	TAB	18,000.00						
3.	ALLOPURINOL 100mg	3,000	TAB	15,000.00						
4.	ALLOPURINOL 300mg	500	TAB	5,000.00						
5.	AMBROXOL 30MG	3,000	TAB	21,000.00						
6.	AMLODIPINE 10MG	30,000	TAB	144,000.00						
7.	AMLODIPINE 10MG + LOSARTAN 100MG	5,000	TAB	90,000.00						
8.	AMLODIPINE 5MG	30,000	TAB	90,000.00						
9.	AMOXICILLIN 500MG	2,500	CAP	15,000.00						
10.	ASCORBIC 500mg	60,000	TAB	360,000.00						
11.	ASPIRIN 80 mg ENTERIC COATED	3,000	TAB	12,000.00						

12.	ATORVASTATIN 10 mg	2,500	TAB	25,000.00						
13.	ATS (SERUM ANTI TETANUS 1500IU/ML, 1ML SOLUTION FOR INJECTION	75	AMP	6,750.00						
14.	AZITHROMYCIN 500mg	250	TAB	19,917.50						
15.	BACILLUS CLAUSII	2,500	AMP	112,500.00						
16.	BETAHISTINE dihydrochloride 16mg	500	TAB	17,250.00						
17.	BETAMETHASONE 0.1% CREAM 5G	100	TUBE	14,900.00						
18.	BETAMETHASONE 500MCG + GENTAMYCIN 1MG + TOLNAFTATE 10MG + CLIOQUINOL 10MG CREAM, 5G	15	TUBE	10,200.00						
19.	BETAMETHASONE+LEVOC ETIRIZINE DIHCl 1MG/5MG FILM-COATED	500	TAB	14,375.00						
20.	BISACODYL 5mg sugar-coated tablet	500	TAB	2,500.00						
21.	BUDESONIDE 250MCG/ML, 2ML RESPIRATORY SOLUTION	500	NEB	27,500.00						
22.	BUTAMIRATE 50mg MODIFIED RELEASE TABLET	3,000	TAB	46,500.00						
23.	CANDESARTAN CILEXETIL 8MG	5,000	TAB	125,000.00						
24.	CAPTOPRIL 25mg	1,500	TAB	4,500.00						
25.	CARBAMAZEPINE 200mg	150	TAB	337.50						
26.	CARBIMAZOLE 5MG	250	TAB	3,000.00						

27.	CARBOCYSTEINE 500MG	3,000	CAP	18,000.00					
28.	CARVEDILOL 25 mg	1,500	TAB	10,890.00					
29.	CARVEDILOL 6.25 mg	1,500	TAB	7,500.00					
30.	CEFALEXIN 500mg	3,000	CAP	19,200.00					
31.	CEFIXIME 400MG CAPSULE	250	CAP	8,250.00					
32.	CEFTRIAXONE 1g POWDER FOR INJECTION + 10ML DILUENT	250	VIAL	92,000.00					
33.	CEFUROXIME 500MG	2,500	TAB	110,000.00					
34.	CEFUROXIME 750MG POWDER FOR INJECTION	250	VIAL	22,500.00					
35.	CELECOXIB 200mg	2,500	CAP	47,500.00					
36.	CETIRIZINE 10mg	3,000	TAB	13,500.00					
37.	CHLORPHENAMINE 4mg	1,500	TAB	1,485.00					
38.	CHLORPHENAMINE MALEATE IM/IV	15	AMP	247.50					
39.	CHLORPROMAZINE 100mg	1,000	TAB	5,630.00					
40.	CIPROFLOXACIN 500mg	2,500	TAB	20,000.00					
41.	CITICHOLINE 500mg	3,000	TAB	126,000.00					
42.	CITICHOLINE 500mg/5ml	50	AMP	10,750.00					
43.	CLINDAMYCIN 300mg	250	CAP	9,250.00					
44.	CLOBETASOL PROPRIONATE 0.05% CREAM, 5G	50	TUBE	5,750.00					
45.	CLONIDINE 75MCG	1,000	TAB	52,500.00					
46.	CLOPIDOGREL 75mg	5,000	TAB	92,500.00					

47.	CLOXACILLIN 500mg	3,000	CAP	33,000.00						
48.	CO-AMOXICLAV 1000MG/200MG POWDER FOR INJECTION	25	VIAL	5,375.00						
49.	CO-AMOXICLAV 625MG	3,000	TAB	57,000.00						
50.	COLCHICINE 500mcg	500	TAB	2,050.00						
51.	COTRIMOXAZOLE 800MG + 160MG	500	TAB	1,950.00						
52.	DE-OILED, ENRICHED PHOSPHOLIPIDS 300mg HARD CAPSULE	5,000	CAP	310,000.00						
53.	DEXAMETHASONE + TOBRAMYCIN 0.1% + 0.3%, 5ML EYE DROPS	15	BOT	7,350.00						
54.	DIGOXIN 250mcg	2,500	TAB	12,500.00						
55.	DIGOXIN 250MCG/ML 2ML	10	AMP	2,100.00						
56.	DIOSMIN+HESPERIDIN	500	TAB	47,500.00						
57.	DIPHENHYDRAMINE 50MG	3,000	CAP	10,500.00						
58.	DIPHENHYDRAMINE 50MG/ML, 1ML SOLUTION FOR INJECTION	10	AMP	980.00						
59.	DOPAMINE 40MG/ML, 5ML SOLUTION FOR INJECTION	5	AMP	1,172.50						
60.	DOXOFYLLINE 100MG	2,500	TAB	62,500.00						
61.	DOXYCYLINE 100mg	2,500	CAP	35,425.00						
62.	ENALAPRIL 20MG	2,500	TAB	30,000.00						
63.	EPINEPHRINE 1MG/ML, 1ML SOLUTION FOR INJECTION	30	AMP	2,400.00						

64.	ERYTHROMYCIN 0.5%, 3.5G EYE OINTMENT	10	TUBE	1,795.00					
65.	ESOMEPRAZOLE 40mg	2,500	CAP	362,500.00					
66.	FEBUXOSTAT 40mg	3,000	TAB	36,000.00					
67.	FENOFIBRATE 160MG TABLET	1,500	TAB	45,375.00					
68.	FINASTERIDE 5mg	1,000	TAB	12,000.00					
69.	FLUOCINOLONE ACETONIDE + NEOMYCIN + POLYMXIN B 0.025% + 3.5MG + 10,000 UNITS/ ML, 5ML EAR DROPS	10	BOT	2,090.00					
70.	FOLIC ACID 5MG	30,000	TAB	150,000.00					
71.	FUROSEMIDE 10mg/ML, 2ML SOLUTION FOR INJECTION	10	AMP	200.00					
72.	FUROSEMIDE 40mg	2,500	TAB	6,250.00					
73.	GABAPENTIN 100mg	500	CAP	10,000.00					
74.	GABAPENTIN 300MG	250	CAP	5,000.00					
75.	GLICLAZIDE 80mg	2,500	TAB	12,500.00					
76.	GLIMEPERIDE 2MG	2,500	TAB	37,500.00					
77.	GLUTAMINE, FIBER, OLIGOSACCHARRIDE (GFO)	2,500	SCHT	514,775.00					
78.	GUAIFENESIN	5,000	CAP	60,000.00					
79.	HYDROCORTISONE 100mg POWDER FOR INJECTION	100	VIAL	9,500.00					
80.	HYDROGEN PEROXIDE 120MI	50	BOT	3,000.00					
81.	HYOSCINE AMP	15	AMP	525.00					
82.	HYPROMELLOSE 0.3%, 10ML EYE DROPS	15	BOT	4,470.00					

83.	INSULIN BASAGINE (GLARGINE)	10	VIAL	5,950.00					
84.	INSULIN BIPHASIC ISOPHANE HUMAN INSULIN 70/30, 100IU/ML, 10ML SOLUTION	10	VIAL	5,950.00					
85.	INSULIN REGULAR RDNA HUMAN 100IU/ML, 10ML SOUTION (HUMULIN R)	10	VIAL	4,250.00					
86.	IPRATROPIUM + SALBUTAMOL 500MCG + 2.5MG, 2.5ML RESPIRATORY SOLUTION	1,000	AMP	32,500.00					
87.	ISOSORBIDE-5- MONONITRATE 30mg MODIFIED RELEASE	5,000	TAB	93,250.00					
88.	ISOSORBIDE-5- MONONITRATE 60mg MODIFIED RELAESE	5,000	TAB	52,500.00					
89.	KETOANALOGUES 600MG	5,000	TAB	180,000.00					
90.	KETOCONAZOLE 2% 15GCREAM	25	TUBE	3,000.00					
91.	LAGUNDI 600MG (VITEX NEGUNDO L.)	3,000	TAB	10,230.00					
92.	LIDOCAINE 2%, 5ML SOLUTION FOR INJECTION	50	AMP	2,300.00					
93.	LINAGLIPTIN 50MG	5,000	TAB	300,000.00					
94.	LOPERAMIDE 2mg	2,500	CAP	9,500.00					
95.	LOSARTAN 50mg	25,000	TAB	225,000.00					
96.	MEFENAMIC ACID 500mg	2,500	CAP	27,000.00					
97.	METFORMIN 500mg tablet	6,000	TAB	45,480.00					

98.	METOCLOPRAMIDE 10MG	500	TAB	4,000.00					
99.	METOCLOPRAMIDE IM/IV	30	AMP	1,800.00					
100.	METOPROLOL 50mg tablet	7,500	TAB	22,500.00					
101.	METRONIDAZOLE 500mg	2,500	TAB	49,975.00					
102.	METRONIDAZOLE 5MG/ML, 100ML SOLUTION FOR INJECTION	25	VIAL	1,425.00					
103.	MONTELUKAST Na 10mg	1,500	TAB	13,005.00					
104.	MULTIVITAMINS CAPSULE	50,000	TAB	245,000.00					
105.	MUPIROCIN 2% CREAM 15g	50	TUBE	7,507.00					
106.	OFLOXACIN 0.3%, 5ML EAR DROPS	15	BOT	4,275.00					
107.	OFLOXACIN 200mg	1,500	TAB	6,450.00					
108.	OFLOXACIN 2MG/ML 100ML IV INFUSION	25	BOT	3,750.00					
109.	OMEPRAZOLE 40MG	1,500	CAP	130,950.00					
110.	OMEPRAZOLE 40MG POWDER FOR INJECTION + 10ML DILUENT	35	VIAL	11,725.00					
111.	PARACETAMOL 150MG/ML, 2ML SOLUTION FOR INJECTION	30	AMP	780.00					
112.	PARACETAMOL 325mg+PHENYLPROPANOL AMINE 25mg + DEXTROMETHORPHAN 10mg	5,000	CAP	50,000.00					

113.	PARACETAMOL 500mg	5,000	TAB	11,250.00					
114.	PARACETAMOL 500mg+ PHENYLEPHRINE 25mg + CHLORPHENAMINE MALEATE 2MG	5,000	TAB	50,000.00					
115.	PARACETAMOL+PROPYPH ENAZONE+CAFFEINE	2,000	TAB	20,000.00					
116.	PARACETAMOL+TRAMADO L CAP	1,500	TAB	45,000.00					
117.	PINENE 31mg, CAMPHENE 15mg, CINEOL 3mg, FENCHONE 4mg, BORNEOL 10mg, ANETHOL 4mg, OLIVE OIL 33mg CAPSULE	5,000	CAP	280,000.00					
118.	PIRACETAM 800MG FILM COATED	500	TAB	21,000.00					
119.	POLYMYXIN B SULFATE 0.71mg+ BACITRACIN ZINC 10mg + NEOMYCIN SULFATE 5mg SKIN OINTMENT 3.5G	5	TUBE	1,150.00					
120.	POLYMYXIN+NEOMYCIN+ DEXAMETHASONE EYE DROPS	25	BOT	5,625.00					
121.	POTASSIUM 10mEq SUSTAINED RELAESE TABLET	2,500	TAB	55,500.00					
122.	POVIDONE IODINE 1 GALLON	6	GAL	5,100.00					
123.	PROPYLTHIOURACIL 50MG TABLET	500	TAB	6,500.00					

124.	Protein 15.9g, fat 14g, carbohydrate 57.4g FOS/inulin 4.3g, water 5g, Vit. A palmitate 450mcg-RE, Vitamin A 20mcg, Vit. D3 4.8mcg, Vit. E 7.9mg, Vit. K1 21mcg, Vit. C 54mg, folic acid 130mcg, Vit.B1 0.8mg, Vit.B2 0.8mg, Vit. B6 1mg, Vit. B12 1.5mcg, niacin 8.2mg, pantothenic acid 4.2mg, biotin 18mcg, choline 136mg, Na 360mg, K 670mg, Cl 550mg, Ca 450mg, phosphorus 270mg, mg 80mg, Fe 2.4mg, Zn 4.7mg, manganese 1.4mg, Copper 285mcg, iodine 64mcg, selenium 22 mcg, chromium 23 mcg, molybdenum 42mcg PER 100g (800g) COMPLETE & BALANCED NUTRITION	100	CAN	149,900.00					
125.	RANITIDINE 25MG/ML, 2ML SOLUTION FOR INJECTION	25	AMP	594.50					
126.	ROSUVASTATIN 20MG	2,500	TAB	55,850.00					
127.	SALBUTAMOL 2mg	2,500	TAB	12,500.00					
128.	SALBUTAMOL+ GUAIFENESIN	5,000	CAP	30,000.00					
129.	SALMETEROL + FLUTICASONE 250MCG + 25MCG, 120 ACTUATIONS METERED DOSE INHALER	100	PC	39,200.00					
130.	Sambucus nigra L. Primula Veris L. & Primula elatior Rumex Crispus Verbena Officinalis Gentiana lutea	1,500	TAB	27,000.00					

131.	SILYBIN- PHOSPHATIDYLCHOLINE (1:2 RATIO) 120mg Di-Alpha- tocopheryl acetate 12 mg Thiamine Mononitrate 1.1mg Riboflavin 1.1mg Niacinamide 14mg Pyridoxine HCl 1.3mg Cyanocobalamin 2.4mcg Calcium Pantothenate 5.4mg Zinc 5mg	3,000	CAP	114,000.00					
132.	SIMVASTATIN 40mg	2,500	TAB	15,000.00					
133.	SITAGLIPTIN PHOSPHATE 50MG	5,000	TAB	300,000.00					
134.	Sitagliptin Phosphate Monohydrate-64.25mg + Metformin Hydrochloride 500mg tablet	2,500	TAB	192,500.00					
135.	SPIRONOLACTONE 25mg	1,500	TAB	217,500.00					
136.	SULFUR SOAP	100	PC	11,000.00					
137.	TAMSULOSIN 200mcg	3,000	CAP	126,840.00					
138.	TELMISARTAN 40MG + AMLODIPINE 5MG	1,500	TAB	45,000.00					
139.	TELMISARTAN 80MG	1,500	TAB	51,000.00					
140.	TETANUS TOXOID 40IU/0.5ML	75	AMP	6,000.00					
141.	THIAMAZOLE 10MG	250	TAB	6,250.00					
142.	TOBRAMYCIN EYE DROPS	10	BOT	2,998.90					
143.	TRAMADOL 50MG CAPSULE	1,000	CAP	18,000.00					
144.	TRAMADOL 50mg/ML, 2ML SOLUTION FOR INJECTION	15	AMP	1,424.55					

145.	TRANEXAMIC ACID 500mg	250	CAP	12,245.00						
146.	TRANEXAMIC ACID 500mg im/iv	10	AMP	3,700.00						
147.	TRIMETAZIDINE 35MG MODIFIED RELEASE TABLET	3,000	TAB	39,990.00						
148.	VILDAGLIPTIN 50MG	1,500	TAB	87,000.00						
149.	VILDAGLIPTIN 50MG + METFORMIN 500MG	1,500	TAB	102,000.00						
150.	VIT. B1 100mg, VIT. B6 5mg, Vit. B12 50mcg TABLET	60,000	TAB	660,000.00						
151.	VIT. B1, VIT. B2, VIT. B3, VIT. B6, ASCORBIC ACID, D- PANTHENOL, DEXTROSE SOLUTION FOR INJECTION 20mL AMPULE	10	AMP	340.00						
152.	VITAMIN D3 800IU SOFTGEL	2,500	CAP	26,025.00						

GROUP B – VARIOUS MEDICAL AND LABORATORY SUPPLIES

NO.	ITEM DESCRIPTION	QTY	UOM	Bidder's Offer
-----	------------------	-----	-----	----------------

(Kindly indicate the complete information below especially the specifications & brand for each item. Put "NO BID", if applicable)

				ABC (₱)	Complete Specifications	Brand	Country of Origin	Manufacturer	CPR No.
1.	ALCOHOL 70% 500 ML	250	BOT	30,000.00					
2.	AMBU BAG (BAG VALVE MASK) PVC, ADULT	1	PC	1,300.00					
3.	ARM SLING	25	PC	5,000.00					
4.	BASIN, KIDNEY, STAINLESS	1	PC	295.00					
5.	BLADE HOLDER (SCALPEL HANDLE), STAINLESS	1	PC	290.00					
6.	CARDIAC BOARD, STANDARD	1	PC	3,000.25					
7.	CLAMP, TOWEL	2	PC	600.00					
8.	COTTON BALL 300pcs/pack	250	PCK	32,500.00					
9.	DIAPER, ADULT LARGE	100	PC	7,500.00					

10.	DIAPER, ADULT MEDIUM	150	PC	11,250.00					
11.	DISINFECTANT SPRAY 500g	50	CAN	14,000.00					
12.	DISPOSABLE SHAVER	50	PC	1,500.00					
13.	DISPOSABLE SYRINGE 50cc	50	PC	4,500.00					
14.	DISPOSABLE SYRINGE INSULIN SYRINGE 100'S	2	BOX	1,000.00					
15.	EASY TOUGH BLOOD CHOLESTEROL STRIPS	5	BOX	6,500.00					
16.	EASY TOUCH BLOOD URIC ACID STRIPS	5	BOX	6,500.00					
17.	ELASTIC BANDAGE 2 X 6	15	PC	510.00					
18.	ELASTIC BANDAGE 3 X 6	15	PC	750.00					
19.	ELASTIC BANDAGE 6 X 6	15	PC	1,650.00					
20.	FACE MASK, MEDICAL, ADULT	100	BOX	14,000.00					
21.	FORCEPS, KELLY CURVE	2	PC	1,300.00					
22.	FORCEPS, KELLY STRAIGHT	2	PC	1,300.00					
23.	GLUCOMETER	5	UNIT	8,000.00					
24.	GLUCOSE TEST STRIPS	15	BOX	19,500.00					
25.	GOWN, LABORATORY	1	PC	160.00					
26.	I.V. CANNULA G.20/G.22, 100'S	5	BOX	10,500.00					
27.	I.V. STARTER KIT	15	PCK	1,125.00					

28.	ICE BAG / HOT WATER BAG	5	PC	600.00					
29.	MEDICAL SHARPS DISPOSABLE BOX, 5L	30	PC	6,000.00					
30.	MICROPORE 1" 12'S	25	BOX	12,250.00					
31.	MOUTH WASH, ANTIMICROBIAL 120ML	15	BOT	2,250.00					
32.	MORTAR AND PESTLE, MARBLE	1	PC	899.75					
33.	NEBULIZING KIT	50	PC	2,250.00					
34.	NEEDLE HOLDER	2	PC	1,250.00					
35.	NGT FEEDING TUBE SILICONE, ADULT	25	PC	6,000.00					
36.	OXYGEN CANNULA NASAL PRONG, ADULT	30	PC	1,650.00					
37.	OXYGEN FACE MASK, ADULT	10	PC	850.00					
38.	PAPER TOWEL, INTERFOLDED 1 PLY	150	PCK	33,000.00					
39.	STERILE LANCETS 100'S	10	PCK	3,000.00					
40.	SUCTION TIP, ORANGE	5	PC	1,547.50					
41.	SURGICAL GLOVES size 7.5	50	PC	1,250.00					
42.	SURGICAL GLOVES size 8	50	PC	1,250.00					
43.	TISSUE PAPER, 2-PLY 12's	100	PCK	16,000.00					
44.	TRANSPORE TAPE 3M	5	BOX	4,950.00					
45.	UNDERPAD, ADULT, 10 SHEETS/PACK	100	PCK	40,000.00					

46.	VACOSSET ADULT	50	PCS	3,750.00					
47.	WET WIPES, 80 SHEETS/PACK	150	PCS	17,850.00					
48.	IV EXTENSION TUBING 3MM	25	PCS	3,000.00					
49.	IV SPLINT, ADULT, WITH STRAP	50	PCS	10,000.00					
50.	BP APPARATUS, ANEROID, MANUAL, ADULT	7	PC	10,500.00					
51.	BP APPARATUS, EMERGENCY, 3 WHEELS HOLDER	1	PC	3,000.00					
52.	HOSPITAL BED LINEN, APPLE GREEN, FITTED, 80 X 36 INCHES	25	PC	10,000.00					
53.	HOSPITAL BED MATRESS, LEATHERETTE, 80 X 36 INCHES	10	PC	50,000.00					
54.	MEDICAL OXYGEN GAUGE REGULATOR	2	PC	6,000.00					
55.	MEDICAL OXYGEN OCTOPUS REGULATOR	1	PC	10,000.00					
56.	NEBULIZING MACHINE	5	PC	12,500.00					
57.	PILLOW, STANDARD SIZE, LEATHERETTE	10	PC	5,000.00					
58.	STETHOSCOPE, BRANDED, HEAVY	5	PC	35,000.00					

	DUTY, US MANUFACTURED								
59.	URINAL, PLASTIC	10	PC	2,000.00					
60.	MEDICAL OXYGEN 50LBS CONTENT WITH TANK	15	PC	148,500.00					
61.	MEDICAL OXYGEN 20LBS CONTENT WITH TANK	5	PC	46,500.00					

I hereby certify that the above information is good for agreement.

Signature Over Printed Name of Authorized Representative.: _____

Name of Company: _____

SECTION 2. No. 14. Bid Security (14.2)

FROM	TO
14.2. The Bid and bid security shall be valid until June 29, 2022 . Any Bid not accompanied by an acceptable bid security shall be rejected by the Procuring Entity as non-responsive	14.2. The Bid and bid security shall be valid until July 19, 2023 . Any Bid not accompanied by an acceptable bid security shall be rejected by the Procuring Entity as non-responsive

FOR FURTHER INQUIRIES, PLEASE CONTACT THE BUCCOR-BAC CHAIRMAN OR BUCCOR BAC SECRETARIAT AT
iwahigprisonandpenalfarmbac@gmail.com

ISSUED THIS DAY 10

TH MARCH 2023 AT IWAHIG PRISON AND PENAL FARM, PUERTO PRINCESA CITY, PALAWAN


CINSP JOCELYN A RODRIGUEZ
BAC-CHAIRMAN